			
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        




 BOARD  OF  TRUSTEES



CLOUD  COUNTY  COMMUNITY  COLLEGE


	

September  27,  2016






MISSION

Cloud County Community College is dedicated to delivering high quality, innovative, affordable, and accessible educational opportunities and services that prepare a diverse population to be critical thinkers and lifelong learners who can meet the challenges of an ever-changing global community.

To assure the delivery of this mission, Cloud County Community College is directed by valid and reliable assessment techniques, which measure the effectiveness and efficiency of all departments in the delivery of curriculum and services in support of student academic success.



VISION

Cloud County Community College strives to enrich the lives of our students and the communities we serve.

		
 CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE
 BOARD OF TRUSTEES

AGENDA  -  September 27, 2016                                                                                           
 

 Meeting Place:     Room 257 in the President’s Addition			
	           Time:      7:00 p.m.  
 
 
  1.	Call to Order – 7:00 p.m.

  2.	Adopt Agenda          	                      				                             
  
  3.	Guests’ Comments

  4.	Student Senate

A. Concordia Campus
B. Geary County Campus

  5.	Fall Athletic Teams

			A.	Men’s and Women’s Cross Country
			B.	Men’s Soccer
			C.	Women’s Volleyball 

  6.	Consent Agenda							           										                    			
			A.	Approval of Minutes of August 30, 2016
			B.     Treasurer’s Report
			C.     Purchasing and Payment of Claims
							  	 
  7.	Reports
	                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                             			A. 	President’s Message
			B.	Vice President for Academic Affairs
			C.	Vice President for Administrative Services
			D.	Vice President for Student Affairs and Advancement
			E.	Vice President for Information Technology
		    F.	Meetings Trustees Attended
			
  8.	Discussion Items

			A.	Policy AP3 – Salary and Payroll
	
  9.       Action Items   

A. Policy F-29 – Campus Security
B. Approval of Purchase of Replacement  Mini Vans

10.	 Other

11.	     Executive Session 






NEXT MEETING – October 25, 2016
CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
September 27, 2016


ITEM NO:        1     

AGENDA ITEM:     Call to Order – 7:00 p.m.

ITEM TYPE:	


COMMENT:
            





























CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
September 27, 2016


ITEM NO:       2     

AGENDA ITEM:     Adopt Agenda

ITEM TYPE:	Decision


COMMENT:


Parliamentary rules recommend the adoption of the Agenda.























RECOMMENDED ACTION:

Adopt the Agenda for the September 27, 2016 Board of Trustees meeting.

CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
September 27, 2016


ITEM NO:       3     
   
ITEM TYPE:		Guests’ Comments


COMMENT:
































CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
September 27, 2016


ITEM NO:       4     
   
ITEM TYPE:		Student Senate


COMMENT:


A.	Concordia Campus.


B.	Geary County Campus.


























CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
September 27, 2016


ITEM NO:       5     
   
ITEM TYPE:		Fall Athletic Teams


COMMENT:


A.	Men’s and Women’s Cross Country.


B.	Men’s Soccer.


C.	Women’s Volleyball.























CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
September 27, 2016 


ITEM NO:       6     

AGENDA ITEM:	Consent Agenda

ITEM TYPE:             Decision


COMMENT: 	


A. Approval of Minutes of August 30, 2016.   The minutes of the regular meeting of August 30, 2016 are enclosed.   


B. Treasurer’s Report.   The Treasurer’s Report as of August 31, 2016 shows a balance of $9,310,422.22 at Central National Bank.  


C. Purchasing and Payment of Claims.   The purchase orders are enclosed or are available from the Clerk of the Board.





	







                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                           
RECOMMENDED ACTION:

Approve the items included in the Consent Agenda as presented.
[bookmark: _GoBack]
CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
September 27,  2016


(A)  LIST
APPROVAL OF EXPENDITURES OR TRANSFERS OF COLLEGE FUNDS OVER $10,000.
This list contains requests for approval of expenditures or transfers of college funds over $10,000. 
For some of the items listed, checks will be released prior to the next Board meeting and approval 
of this list by the Board at this meeting will also authorize release of the checks.  The other items,
orders will be prepared, and the payment of claims will be approved at the next Board meeting.
 


1.	01-73-7303-799	PowerFaids Maintenance	Maintenance renewal	   $  13,684.00

2.	01-34-2010-516	CCCC	TRiO Fringe Benefits              15,260.16	
				    (Sept-Dec)

3.	01-34-2010-796	CCCC	TRiO Indirect Funds                17,632.30 

4.	01-85-9100-741	Consolidated Management	Meals – 8-18 to 9-7                  41,279.94


	








	

















CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
September 27, 2016


ITEM NO:        7

AGENDA ITEM:	     Reports

ITEM TYPE:		     Information 

COMMENT:


A.	President’s Message.   

	
B.	Vice President for Academic Affairs.
	    

C.	Vice President for Administrative Services.

1) Financial Overview 

2) Facilities


D.	Vice President for Student Affairs and Advancement.


E.		Vice President for Information Technology.


F. Meetings Trustees Attended.








CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
September 27, 2016
	

ITEM NO:      8

AGENDA ITEM:	Discussion Items

ITEM TYPE:		Discussion
 

COMMENT:	


A.	Policy AP3 – Salary and Payroll.   The Fair Labor Standards Act (FLSA) has changed provisions including the payment of overtime.  The threshold for determining Exempt versus Non-Exempt Employees is $47,476.  These changes will be effective December 1, 2016.  Changes to the Procedures to Policy AP3 – Salary and Payroll are brought to this meeting for discussion.  They will be brought to the regular meeting on October 25. 2016 for approval.
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CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
September 27, 2016
	

ITEM NO:       9

AGENDA ITEM:	Action Items

ITEM TYPE:		Decision
 

COMMENT:		


A.	Policy F29 – Campus Security.   In preparing for the officers in the Security Department to be armed, this new policy was brought to the August 30, 2016 Board meeting for discussion.  It is brought to this meeting for approval.  The changes made since the August meeting are shown in red.

RECOMMENDED ACTION:   Approve Policy F29 – Campus Security and the procedures.


B.	Approval of Purchase of Replacement Vehicles.   The college plans to purchase two new 7-passenger mini vans.  Enclosed are the results of the bid process and a recommendation.

	RECOMMENDED ACTION:   Approve the bid of Concordia Chevrolet in the amount of $22,500 including one trade-in, and approve the bid of Womack Sunshine Ford in the amount of $22,975 including one trade-in, and authorize payment from the General Fund.
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CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
September 27, 2016


ITEM NO:      10 

AGENDA ITEM:	Other

ITEM TYPE:		 


COMMENT:






























CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE
BOARD OF TRUSTEES
September 27, 2016


ITEM NO:       11

AGENDA ITEM:	Executive Session

ITEM TYPE:		Executive Session 


COMMENT:
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CLOUD COUNTY COMMUNITY COLLEGE 3

TOPIC: Policy Number
Campus Security - Procedures F29

Officers shall not knowingly make a false report, nor shall any officer knowingly or willfully
make a false entry in any department record or report. If an officer is charged with a crime,
they shall immediately be placed on paid or unpaid administrative leave; and if they are
convicted of a crime, they shall be terminated. Background checks will be performed as part
of the hiring process for an officer and annually thereafter.

Bias-Based Profiling Prohibited

It is unlawful for an officer to use bias-based profiling in constituting a reasonable and
articulable suspicion that an offense has been or is being committed so as to justify a contact,
or in determining the existence of probable cause to conduct a search of an individual or the
individual’s residence or vehicle. All staff of the Security Department shall be prohibited from
engaging in bias-based profiling.

Itis not bias-based profiling when race, ethnicity, national origin, gender or religion is used in
combination with other identifying factors as part of a specific individual description to initiate
an enforcement action.

If, upon completion of an appropriate investigation, it is determined that an employee of the
Security Department has directly violated the policy prohibiting bias-based profiling, the
Security Department shall initiate appropriate disciplinary action consistent with policies with
penalties, including suspensions or termination of the employment of the employee.

Body Cameras

Body cameras are not worn or utilized by the officers of the CCCC Security Department at
this time, but may be allowed upon approval by the Director of Auxiliary Services.

Approval for Firearms and Accessories and Other Weapons

The Security Department Supervisor shall approve all firearms, magazines, holsters,
ammunition, and other weapons used by all officers.

Prohibited Weapons

Security Department staff shall not carry any of the following prohibited weapons while on
duty: weighted nightsticks, weighted gloves, slappers, gasbullies, zipsticks, nunchaku,
brass/steel knuckles or similar devices.

Adopted  Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed
09/
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TOPIC: Policy Number
Campus Security - Procedures F29

Firearms Proficiency Testing

The standard of proficiency for the CCCC Security Department shall be the State of Kansas
P.0.S.T Firearms Qualification Course (KS-CPOST), which is required for all law
enforcement agencies throughout the state of Kansas. Every off-duty law enforcement officer
who is authorized to carry a firearm shall be required to maintain departmental proficiency
standards with their duty firearm through their full-time law enforcement employer.

Firearms proficiency testing in accordance with KS-CPOST shall be held on an annual basis
through either the Concordia Police Department or other state-certified range master,
instructor for retired officers, or other part-time non-law enforcement officers. Letters of
proficiency must be submitted at hire and yearly thereafter to be on file with the CCCC
Security Department and Human Resources Department. Additionally, officers must provide
documentation of range practice at least three times per year, meeting the metrics of the KS-
CPOST proficiency testing. The goal is to insure officers are practicing at the firing range
approximately every three months.

General Firearms and Weapons Requlations

Officers shall not engage in the unsafe handling of weapons/firearms. An officer is
responsible for and will be held accountable for any accident that occurs from the unsafe
handling of any weapon/firearm.

The Security Department Supervisor or his/her designee shall maintain a firearms registry
that indicates and identifies the firearms approved for possession and carry by the Security
Department staff.

When an officer discharges a weapon or firearm, they shall complete a Discharge of
Weapons Report detailing the events of the discharge for the CCCC Security Department.

Drawing and Displaying a Firearm

Drawing and displaying a firearm shall be limited to:

1. When an officer, in the exercise of sound judgment, has reason to fear for personal
safety or the safety of others

2. For inspection and training purposes

3. When the firearm is being placed in the Security Department’s weapons safe.

Adopted  Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed
09/
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TOPIC: Policy Number
Campus Security - Procedures F29

Use of Authorized Firearms/Equipment

While in uniform, officers are restricted to carrying only their approved firearm unconcealed.
Any back-up firearm shall first be authorized by the Security Department and the proficiency
qualification letter with that firearm placed on file with the Security Department and the
Human Resources Office. The back-up firearm shall be carried concealed. Officers carrying a
Security Department-provided firearm shall carry and use only ammunition which has been
approved for the Security Department’s firearms.

Only holsters and magazines approved by the Security Department shall be carried by an
officer utilizing a Security Department-provided firearm while on duty.

Any officer authorized to carry a firearm must have it inspected yearly by the college’s
designated armorer.

Part-time officers carrying a Security Department-provided firearm will secure the firearm and
duty gear in the Security Department safe. It is the responsibility of the officer going off shift
to make sure the duty gear and firearm is stowed in a safe manner and the safe is securely
locked before going off shift.

Part-time officers whose primary employment is with a local law enforcement agency may
carry weapons issued to them and owned by the local law enforcement agency, provided
they are also approved by the Security Department. Any equipment owned by a local law
enforcement agency damaged during the line of duty at CCCC will be replaced by CCCC.

The use of body armor is encouraged by the Security Department. Body armor is provided by
the Security Department. Part-time officers whose primary employment is with a local law
enforcement agency may wear body armor issued to them and owned by the local law
enforcement agency. Any equipment owned by a local law enforcement agency damaged
during the line of duty at CCCC will be replaced by CCCC.

Weapons Maintenance/Inspection

It shall be the responsibility of every officer to care for and clean their firearm. Upon use, the
firearm shall be cleaned before returning the firearm to service.

Duty ammunition and practice ammunition for qualifications shall be purchased and provided
by CCCC for Security Department-provided firearms. Duty ammunition used by officers for
the firearm approved but not provided by the Security Department discharged while in the line
of duty for CCCC will be replaced by CCCC.

Adopted Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed
09/
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TOPIC: Policy Number
Campus Security - Procedures F29

Use of Non-Deadly Force

Officers will assess the situation to determine which non-deadly force technique or weapon
will best de-escalate and bring the situation under control in a safe manner.

Drawing and displaying batons and electronic control weapons by the officer shall only be
done when the officer, in exercise of sound judgment, has reason to fear for his/her personal
safety or for the safety of others, for inspection purposes, or during departmentally approved
training.

Handcuffing

Handcuffs or plastic cuffs may be used by officers with prior training only to restrain a
person's hands to ensure officer safety. Officers should consider handcuffing any person they
reasonably believe warrants that degree of restraint. However, officers should not conclude
that in order to avoid risk every person should be handcuffed, regardless of the
circumstances.

Baton/Expandable Baton

Officers with prior training are encouraged to carry a baton/expandable baton while on duty,
and are authorized to use the baton when they reasonably believe that such force is
necessary in defense of their safety or safety of another person.

Chemical Weapons (Oleoresin Capsicum, OC “pepper spray”)

Officers with prior training are encouraged to carry OC spray. The purpose for utilizing OC
spray must be limited to the protection of the officer or others who are under immediate
physical attack and will in no way be used to otherwise influence, intimidate or detain an
individual regardless of circumstance.

EMDD (Electro-Muscular Disruption Device, i.e. Taser/Stun Gun)

Officers with prior training are encouraged to carry an EMDD while on duty that will be
provided by the Security Department.

Adopted  Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed
09/
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TOPIC: Policy Number
Campus Security - Procedures F29

Officers who encounter subjects armed with an EMDD shall use extreme care. Many factors
will dictate what level of force the officer should utilize in responding to the threatened use of
an EMDD. The officer is justified in the use of any force reasonably necessary to defend the
officer or another from bodily harm or the threat of bodily harm.

Discharging Firearms/Use of Deadly Force

Pursuant to the Statutes of the State of Kansas, an officer is authorized to discharge a
firearm or to use any other force likely to cause death or serious injury under the following
circumstances:

1. When the officer reasonably believes that such force is necessary to prevent death
or great bodily harm to the officer or to another person. The threat of imminent
danger must be accompanied by a reasonable belief that the subject has the ability
and opportunity to cause death or great bodily harm, and the officer reasonably
believes that jeopardy exists.

2. When the officer has probable cause to believe that a person has committed, or
attempted to commit, a felony involving great bodily harm, is attempting to escape
by the use of a deadly weapon, or otherwise indicates that they will endanger
human life or inflict great bodily harm.

3. An officer is also authorized to discharge a firearm at an approved range or area
where all appropriate safety precautions can be observed.

An officer is not authorized to discharge a firearm when use of less force would safely
accomplish the objective, to fire a warning shot, or fire from a moving vehicle.

Discharge of a Firearm

Immediately following the discharge of a firearm and when the situation stabilizes, whether
death or injury occurs, a thorough and objective investigation shall be conducted. The officer
involved in the shooting shall notify the local police department and the Director of Auxiliary
Services. Once on scene, the local police department will take control of the event. In the
event an officer has an accidental/negligent discharge of a firearm, the Director of Auxiliary
Services and the Security Supervisor shall be notified.

Adopted Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed
09/
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TOPIC: Policy Number
Campus Security - Procedures F29

Written reports are required on all incidents that involve the discharge of a weapon or the use
of force by an officer. Officers will include in their reports an explanation of any discharge of a
weapon or use of force, articulating the reasonableness of the force used in regard to the
suspect's ability, opportunity, and the jeopardy that was present. The report shall also
document any injury to officers, subjects, or to other persons as a result of the force used.

If an individual or officer is injured during the incident, the Director of Auxiliary Services and
the Security Supervisor shall be notified immediately by the officer or his/her designee.

Preliminary reports of incidents and arrests involving the use of force by an officer shall be
completed before the end of their shift and submitted to the Director of Auxiliary Services. A
completed in-depth report shall be submitted within 24 hours.

The Director of Auxiliary Services will initiate an investigation into the use of force. The
findings of the investigation shall be reviewed by the Vice President for Administrative
Services or his/her designee. Together they will determine what actions will be taken.

Adopted  Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed
09/
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Concordia Campus Geary County Campus Online & Outreach

P.O. Box 1002 631 Caroline Avenue 1.800.729.5101

2221 Campus Drive Junction City, KS 66441 www.cloud.edu
oncordia, KS 66901 785.238.8010

785.243.1435 Fax: 785.238.2898

Fax: 785.243.1043

Memorandum

To:  Board of Trustees

From: Amy Lange, Vice President for Administrative Services
Danette Toone, President
Date: 9/27/2016

Re:  Approval of Purchase of Replacement Mini Vans

Cloud County Community College intends to purchase two new 7-passenger mini vans to
replace two current 7-passenger mini vans. The primary use of these vans is for transportation of
students to and from activities, including but not limited to athletic competitions, agriculture
Jjudging competitions, academic challenge competitions, and academic field trips.

Two 7-passenger mini vans will be used as trade-ins as part of this purchase. Van #17 is a 2001
Ford Windstar with 249,740 miles. Van #38 is a 2004 Dodge Grand Caravan SE with 190,329
miles.

Bid invitations were sent to Beloit Motor Company (Beloit, KS), Concordia Chevrolet
(Concordia, KS), George Motor Company (Clyde, KS), Glavan Ford (Clay Center, KS), and
‘Womack Sunshine Ford (Concordia, KS), and were advertised on the college website and in the

Blade-Empire.
Sealed bids were opened at 2:30 p.m. on Friday, September 16, 2016. Results follow.

Concordia Glavan Ford Womack Beloit Motor George Motor
Chevrolet Sunshine Ford Company Company
Vehicle #1 $23,500 $23,355.72 $23,275 No Bid No Bid

2016 Chrysler Town | 2017 Ford Transit | 2017 Ford Transit
& Country, 21,000 Connect, 10 miles Connect, 0-20 miles
miles

Vehicle #2 $22,000 $23,355.72 $23,275 No Bid No Bid

2015 Chrysler Town | 2017 Ford Transit | 2017 Ford Transit
& Country, 37,384 Connect, 10 miles Connect, 0-20 miles
miles

e b R S
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Trade-In#1 | ($1,000) ($500) ($300) No Bid No Bid
Trade-In#2 | ($1,000) ($500) ($300) No Bid No Bid
Total Bid $43,500 $45,711.44 $45,950 No Bid No Bid
Delivery Date #1 7-10 days, #2 6-8 weeks after November 24 —

Immediately receipt of order December 10

The College intends to add graphics to the vehicles at an estimated cost of $1,000 each, or

$2,000 total.

Recommendation: Approve the bid of Concordia Chevrolet in the amount of $22.500 including
one trade-in, and approve the bid of Womack Sunshine Ford in the amount of $22,975 including

one trade-in, and authorize payment from the General Fund.
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Topic: Policy Number:
Salary and Payroll - Procedures AP3

Non-exempt employees shall record all hours worked on a daily basis utilizing the
approved time card. Accrued paid leave shall also be recorded on the time card as
though those hours were actually worked. Unpaid leave shall be recorded on the time
card by the designation “unpaid leave”. Non-exempt employees will not work overtime
hours without the explicit approval of his/her immediate supervisor.

If a non-exempt employee is approved to work over 40 hours in a defined workweek, that
employee will be paid according to the fluctuating workweek method set forth in the Fair
Labor Standards Act regulations at 29 CFR 778.114. In calculating the number of
hours worked in any given workweek for overtime purposes, all leaves, paid and
unpaid, are excluded from the calculation. All other hours recorded (work hours and
leave hours) in a defined workweek will be paid at his/her regular rate of pay.

However, a non-exempt employee approved to work over 40 hours in a defined
workweek may take compensatory time off in lieu of overtime pay, provided that a written
agreement to that effect is executed between the employee and his/her supervisor and a
copy of the agreement is filed with the Office of Human Resources. Compensatory time
off will be at the rate of 1.5 times the overtime hours actually worked and may be accrued
to a total of 80 hours. The employee may take compensatory time off after consultation
with his/her supervisor. Compensatory time off in lieu of overtime pay can only be used
to meet, but not exceed, 40 hours in a defined workweek.

If the employment of a non-exempt employee is terminated, either voluntarily or
involuntarily, that employee will be paid for all unused compensatory time at the regular
hourly rate of the employee at the time of termination.

Adopted  Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed Revised/Reviewed
2/18/86 3/19/90 6/18/92 7/1/12014





